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Scaling Methods is written for professionals in the behavioral sciences who analyze data that results from
subjective responses. Other books on scaling attitudes or measuring perceptions focus on the
psychometrician's view of measurement. This book focuses on the users' view by concentrating on effective
ways to analyze data rather than the mathematical details of how each program works. The methods included
handle the majority of data analysis problems encountered and are accompanied by a software solution. Each
chapter features the theory surrounding that methodology, an example, a real-world application, and a
computer solution.

This book introduces the major uni- and multi-dimensional scaling method techniques most common in
educational, social, and psychological research. Using four primary methods of data collection--ordering,
categorical rating, free clustering, and similarity judgments--Scaling Methods, Second Edition explains how
such data can be represented in ways that illustrate relationships among the data and help reveal underlying
dimensional structures. Each method serves as an independent unit so readers can pick and choose from a
variety of easy-to-use procedures and more advanced techniques. The new edition features a new chapter on
order analysis and a CD-ROM that provides stand-alone, as well as SAS supported demonstrations of multi-
dimensional scaling techniques, plus programs to get raw data into matrix form.

The text is written for researchers, practitioners, and advanced students in education and the social and
behavioral sciences interested in analyzing data resulting from subjective responses, especially in the
measurement of attitudes. Each chapter is self-contained making this an excellent resource for use in the
classroom or as a self-study tool. A first course in statistics is a helpful prerequisite.
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From reader reviews:

Elaine Rode:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important normally. The book Scaling Methods seemed to be making you to know
about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The
book Scaling Methods is not only giving you far more new information but also to be your friend when you
experience bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship while
using book Scaling Methods. You never experience lose out for everything when you read some books.

Angela Babb:

The book Scaling Methods has a lot associated with on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of
gain. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research just before write this book.
This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point easily after perusing this book.

Betty Bowers:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
study a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
forms of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us
novel, comics, and soon. The Scaling Methods will give you new experience in reading a book.

Gary Roth:

Book is one of source of expertise. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but in addition
native or citizen need book to know the update information of year to help year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. With the
book Scaling Methods we can take more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? For being creative
person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt
to change your life with that book Scaling Methods. You can more attractive than now.
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