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The observation and manipulation of individual molecules is one of the most exciting developments in
modern molecular science. Single Molecule Science: Physical Principles and Models provides an
introduction to the mathematical tools and physical theories needed to understand, explain, and model
single-molecule observations.

This book explains the physical principles underlying the major classes of single-molecule experiments such
as fluorescence measurements, force-probe spectroscopy, and nanopore experiments. It provides the
framework needed to understand single-molecule phenomena by introducing all the relevant mathematical
and physical concepts, and then discussing various approaches to the problem of interpreting single-molecule
data.

The essential concepts used throughout this book are explained in the appendices and the text does not
assume any background beyond undergraduate chemistry, physics, and calculus. Every effort has been made
to keep the presentation self-contained and derive results starting from a limited set of fundamentals, such as
several simple models of molecular dynamics and the laws of probability. The result is a book that develops
essential concepts in a simple yet rigorous way and in a manner that is accessible to a broad audience.
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From reader reviews:

Seth Sawyer:

Within other case, little persons like to read book Single Molecule Science: Physical Principles and Models.
You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some
sort of book Single Molecule Science: Physical Principles and Models. You can add know-how and of
course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can realize
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can open a book or perhaps searching by internet
product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go through.

Donn Chavez:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading
habit give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience happy read one
having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The Single Molecule Science: Physical Principles and
Models is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Nancy Tandy:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the headline Single
Molecule Science: Physical Principles and Models suitable to you? The particular book was written by
renowned writer in this era. The actual book untitled Single Molecule Science: Physical Principles and
Modelsis the main of several books in which everyone read now. This book was inspired a number of people
in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new shape that you ever know previous to. The
author explained their thought in the simple way, so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this
guide. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of
the world with this book.

Paul Kennedy:

Within this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you
must do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the
books in the top collection in your reading list is definitely Single Molecule Science: Physical Principles and
Models. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing to be precious
person. By looking upwards and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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