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As politicians, public bodies and non-Governmental organisations continue to profess an interest in making
peace with the past, this highly original study explores the motivation, significance and legacy of ‘making
public’ experiences of state violence in Northern Ireland.

Based on a synthesis of documentary material with the findings from a series of contemporary interviews,
this timely book uncovers the reasoning behind many Republican former detainees’ accounts of state
violence and torture. It examines the aims of those who ‘went public’ during the conflict and discusses the
meaning they attached to their stories and the various responses to them. It also identifies some of the risks
involved in criticising the violence of the British State and illuminates the ways in which ‘truths’ are often
contested in Northern Ireland - both during the conflict and in the years which have followed. A unique piece
of interdisciplinary work, the study disentangles and evaluates the discourses presented by former detainees
and makes an innovative and interesting contribution to knowledge about transitional justice and legacies of
state violence.

The book is suitable for social science scholars interested in human rights, state violence, criminology and
transitional justice, as well as those seeking to understand more about experiences of imprisonment and the
legacy of the Northern Ireland conflict.
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From reader reviews:

Dirk Sullivan:

The book Transitional Justice and Legacies of State Violence (Routledge Studies in Crime and Society) can
give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a
book Transitional Justice and Legacies of State Violence (Routledge Studies in Crime and Society)? A few
of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim in which book can give many data for us. It is
absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that,
you can give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Transitional Justice and Legacies of State
Violence (Routledge Studies in Crime and Society) has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

Gemma Jackson:

The event that you get from Transitional Justice and Legacies of State Violence (Routledge Studies in Crime
and Society) may be the more deep you rooting the information that hide within the words the more you get
enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Transitional Justice and
Legacies of State Violence (Routledge Studies in Crime and Society) giving you excitement feeling of
reading. The article writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood simply by anyone who
read the idea because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your
current vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this kind of Transitional Justice and Legacies
of State Violence (Routledge Studies in Crime and Society) instantly.

Junior Price:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even restricted. What people must be consider if those
information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously which one would
work to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then you get it as
your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will not happen
throughout you if you take Transitional Justice and Legacies of State Violence (Routledge Studies in Crime
and Society) as the daily resource information.

Jasper Parsons:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
book that need more time to be learn. Transitional Justice and Legacies of State Violence (Routledge Studies



in Crime and Society) can be your answer since it can be read by a person who have those short free time
problems.
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