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Wayne Clough, Secretary of the Smithsonian Institution, asks museums a fundamental question: "How can
we prepare ourselves to reach the generation of digital natives who bring a huge appetite-and aptitude-for the
digital world?" His thoughts on how the Smithsonian is tackling this issue and how others have fared in
museums and libraries around the world are the subject of a new e-book, Best of Both Worlds: Museums,
Libraries, and Archives in a Digital Age.The e-book begins with a summary of what has already taken place
in libraries and archives-documents once available only in the stacks or back rooms are now available, often
for free, through the Internet. The Library of Congress and the National Archives, along with thousands of
local libraries around the country, have led the way in digitizing two-dimensional objects.For museums, the
digital world presents a bigger challenge. Clough cites several reasons for this. First, and most obvious:
Producing images of three-dimensional objects is more complicated than taking a picture of a page and
adding some data. Most museums, including the Smithsonian, previously have not had high levels of
technical expertise and equipment. Adding to the challenge is the simple fact that collections are built with
exhibitions in mind rather than open access on computers.With 137 million objects in its care, how did the
Smithsonian begin the process of digitizing its vast collections to make them accessible to the millions of
people who do not visit the museums in person? Clough describes the journey that began in 2009 with
setting priorities for what would be digitized-a total of 14 million objects."The physical museum offers
visitors the opportunity to experience the real object and share their impressions with family and friends,"
Clough said. "Digital access can then provide limitless opportunities for engagement and lifelong
learning."Museums do not give degrees but they do provide informal education through their research,
scholarship and exhibitions, both real and virtual. Clough sees museums gradually moving beyond
showcasing collections to engaging the public online where the "visitors" can sort out and access the objects
they find most interesting and then interact directly with the museums.Education has always been at the core
of the Smithsonian. Today, the Smithsonian offers materials and lesson plans that meet state standards for K-
12 curricula; online national summits for teens on subjects such as the 1961 Freedom Riders, the
environment and the 1930s Dust Bowl; the Collections Search Center website; and apps such as Leafsnap
that allow people to take a picture of a tree's leaf and have it identified in seconds. One of the most visible
examples of informal education is the Smithsonian's website, www.seriouslyamazing.com, which draws
people in with fun questions and, with another click, takes them deeper into the subject. For example, when
the question "What European colonizer is still invading the U.S. today?" is clicked on, the answer,
earthworms, appears along with further in-depth information on worms from environmental
researchers.Museums have moved slowly-frequently project by project-into the brave new digital world,
according to Clough. There are many good reasons for this cautious path, but "the time for toe-dipping is
ending for museums, since they cannot stand aloof from the rising tide of information convergence."Clough
concludes his 75-page online book with this thought: "While digital technology poses great challenges, it
also offers great possibilities. For the Smithsonian and our nation's other museums, libraries and archives,
today is a time when we can serve the role our founders envisioned for the educational systems of our
republic. We can help all the people,
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Rubio:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require something to
explain what yours problem? How about your time? Or are you busy particular person? If you don't have
spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question since just their can do that.
It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on guardería
until university need this particular Best of Both Worlds: Museums, Libraries, and Archives in the Digital
Age to read.

Myrtle Hamer:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not need people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this Best of Both Worlds: Museums,
Libraries, and Archives in the Digital Age book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of
course the details in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

John Vandorn:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write about
the knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of them is this Best of
Both Worlds: Museums, Libraries, and Archives in the Digital Age.

Gretchen Clark:

Best of Both Worlds: Museums, Libraries, and Archives in the Digital Age can be one of your nice books
that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that
could increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the
information. The author giving his/her effort to put every word into delight arrangement in writing Best of
Both Worlds: Museums, Libraries, and Archives in the Digital Age however doesn't forget the main point,
giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource details that maybe you can be among it. This
great information could drawn you into brand new stage of crucial imagining.
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