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A thrilling fantasy adventure perfect for fans of Tamora Pierce and Sarah Maas

Ravaged by a plague known as Red Death, the planet Gabriel, a former colony of Earth, is a barren
wasteland. Since being abandoned by Earth 500 years ago, resources are scarce and life is cheap. To stay
alive, the survivors, the Citizens, scavenge the remains of a now dead city, trading for food with the
resource-rich Curadores, the only other survivors on Gabriel. Every old computer, every piece of wire, every
scrap of metal counts. To steal is the ultimate sin. So when tough-as-nails seventeen-year-old Leica is caught
doing just that, she's exiled and left to the mercy of Gabriel's unforgiving desert for the rest of her life.

While in exile, Leica discovers a mysterious shuttle, which may not only lead her home, but even more
impossible—reestablish contact with Earth. Then Red Death rears its head again, killing her entire work
crew, leaving Leica all alone until a handsome Curador offers her refuge in the Dome—the only place on
Gabriel untouched by Red Death, where a decadent and sultry life awaits. But there's a catch: Leica can only
enter the Dome as his concubine—his Kisaeng. When a rogue group of Citizens see their chance for
revolution in Leica's good fortune, she finds herself unraveling a deadly mystery with chilling answers to the
true origin of Red Death and the reason Earth really abandoned them so long ago. 

A richly imagined fantasy in the vein of Tamora Pierce, Lotus and Thorn, is a magnificent, epic adventure.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Janice Smith:

Book is written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A book Lotus and Thorn will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that
will open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that?
Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

George Hale:

The book Lotus and Thorn can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must
we leave a very important thing like a book Lotus and Thorn? Wide variety you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to
closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you
could share all of these. Book Lotus and Thorn has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can search the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Sunny Weaver:

The book untitled Lotus and Thorn contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains your ex idea
with easy method. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can
easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of
literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or
device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book,
you can available their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice study.

Jonathan Bean:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source that filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the Lotus and Thorn when you needed it?
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