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When the Civil Rights Act of 1964 and the Immigration and Naturalization Act of 1965 were passed, they
were seen as triumphs of liberal reform. Yet today affirmative action is foundering in the great waves of
immigration from Asia and Latin America, leading to direct competition for jobs, housing, education, and
government preference programs. In Collision Course, Hugh Davis Graham explains how two such well-
intended laws came into conflict with each other when employers, acting under affirmative action plans,
hired millions of new immigrants ushered in by the Immigration Act, while leaving high unemployment
among inner-city blacks. He shows how affirmative action for immigrants stirred wide resentment and drew
new attention to policy contradictions. Graham sees a troubled future for both programs. As the economy
weakens and antiterrorist border controls tighten, the competition for jobs will intensify pressure on
affirmative action and invite new restrictions on immigration. Graham's insightful interpretation of the
unintended consequences of these policies is original and controversial.
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From reader reviews:

Amy Cason:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book titled Collision Course: The Strange
Convergence of Affirmative Action and Immigration Policy in America? Maybe it is to be best activity for
you. You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can smarter than
before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have other opinion?

Iris Wright:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy
man? If you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored
faster. And you have free time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They need to answer
that question since just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes,
it is suitable. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this particular Collision Course:
The Strange Convergence of Affirmative Action and Immigration Policy in America to read.

April Hanson:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole day to reading
a publication. The book Collision Course: The Strange Convergence of Affirmative Action and Immigration
Policy in America it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These were
enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy typically the
e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this
book has high quality.

Janice Garcia:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you know
that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra Collision Course: The
Strange Convergence of Affirmative Action and Immigration Policy in America.
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