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Ever since Karl Jaspers's "axial age" paradigm, there have been a number of influential studies comparing
ancient East Asian and Greco-Roman history and culture. However, to date there has been no comparative
study involving multiple literary traditions in these cultural spheres. This book compares the dynamics
between the younger literary cultures of Japan and Rome and the literatures of their venerable predecessors,
China and Greece. How were writers of the younger cultures of Rome and Japan affected by the presence of
an older "reference culture," whose sophistication they admired, even as they anxiously strove to assert their
own distinctive identity? How did they tackle the challenge of adopting the reference culture's literary
genres, rhetorical refinement, and conceptual vocabulary for writing texts in different languages and within
distinct political and cultural contexts?

Classical World Literatures captures the striking similarities between the ways early Japanese authors wrote
their own literature through and against the literary precedents of China, and the ways Latin writers engaged
and contested Greek precedents. But it also brings to light suggestive divergences that are rooted in
geopolitical, linguistic, sociohistorical, and aesthetic differences between early Japanese and Roman literary
cultures. Proposing a methodology of "deep comparison" for the cross-cultural comparison of premodern
literary cultures and calling for an expansion of world literature debates into the ancient and medieval
worlds, Classical World Literatures is both a theoretical intervention and an invitation to read and re-read
four major literary traditions in an innovative and illuminating light.
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From reader reviews:

John Bennett:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Classical World Literatures: Sino-Japanese
and Greco-Roman Comparisons as your daily resource information.

Richard Segers:

The actual book Classical World Literatures: Sino-Japanese and Greco-Roman Comparisons will bring one
to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try
to find new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Classical World Literatures: Sino-
Japanese and Greco-Roman Comparisons is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book
from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Tony Partee:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their very own reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is this
Classical World Literatures: Sino-Japanese and Greco-Roman Comparisons.

Eun Russell:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on
book like comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Classical World
Literatures: Sino-Japanese and Greco-Roman Comparisons that give your enjoyment preference will be
satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people
to know world far better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly that
reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So ,
for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you may pick Classical World Literatures:
Sino-Japanese and Greco-Roman Comparisons become your own personal starter.
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