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The Web changes how people use content; not just content on the Web, but all content. If your content is not
easy to find and immediately helpful, readers will move on almost at once. We are all children of the Web,
and we come to any information system, including product documentation, looking for the search box and
expecting every search to work like Google. There is no first, last, previous, next, up, or back anymore.
Every Page is Page One.

In this ground-breaking book, Mark Baker looks beyond the usual advice on writing for the Web, and
beyond the idea of topic-based writing merely as an aid to efficiency and reuse, to explore how readers really
use information in the age of the Web and to lay out an approach to planning, creating, managing, and
organizing topic-based documentation that really works for the reader.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Wadsworth:

The book Every Page is Page One gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to
make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting pressure or
having big problem together with your subject. If you can make examining a book Every Page is Page One
to be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your
knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open up and read a
guide Every Page is Page One. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or
other individuals. So , how do you think about this book?

Katherine Shadrick:

The actual book Every Page is Page One will bring you to the new experience of reading a book. The author
style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The
book Every Page is Page One is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your
official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Betsy Aguilar:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is Every Page is Page One this e-book consist a lot of the information in the
condition of this world now. This specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The
vocabulary styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some
study when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book acceptable all of you.

Donna Robinson:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book method, more simple and reachable. This Every Page is Page One can give you a lot of close
friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make an individual
more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide
offer you information that might be your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than additional make
you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let me have Every Page is Page One.
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