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Texas and Texans have been known to boast of having the best or the worst, the most or the least, the largest
or the tiniest of just about everything. Join author Bill Cannon as he reveals facts that depict the colorful
bravado unique to the Lone Star State. For instance, no six but seven flags flew over Texas. In 1832 the
composer of The Star Spangled Banner, Francis Scott Key, was the cousel hired by Sam Houston to defend
him on assault charges. And someone other than Sam Bass may be buried in his grave.

A Treasury of Texas Trivia is complemented by newspaper accounts, photographs, and other documentation
of these and other little-known bits of Texas history.
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From reader reviews:

Desmond Gorman:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Treasury of Texas Trivia. You can choose the best book if
you want reading a book. As long as we know about how is important some sort of book Treasury of Texas
Trivia. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, since
from book you can realize everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will find yourself
known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we could open a book or
searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the
library. Let's learn.

Jeff Puckett:

This Treasury of Texas Trivia tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why.
The reason why of this Treasury of Texas Trivia can be one of several great books you must have is giving
you more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with information that probably will shock your
earlier knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside that this Treasury of Texas Trivia forcing you to have an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we realize it
useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

William Rocha:

The guide with title Treasury of Texas Trivia includes a lot of information that you can study it. You can get
a lot of gain after read this book. This particular book exist new information the information that exist in this
guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you with new era of the internationalization. You
can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Joshua Smith:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book means, more simple and reachable. That Treasury of Texas Trivia can give you a lot of close
friends because by you looking at this one book you have factor that they don't and make you more like an
interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This e-book offer you
information that might be your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than various other make you to be
great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have Treasury of Texas Trivia.
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