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This is the first full-length biography of Kid Nichols (1869-1953), who won 30 or more games a record
seven times and was the youngest pitcher to reach 300 career victories. Much new light is shed on Nichols'
early life in Madison, Wisconsin, along with important influences and experiences as a teenager living in
Kansas City. His professional career is documented by drawing heavily from publications of the era and
Nichols' own words. The high regard in which he was held by fans, teammates and even opponents is
contrasted with his contentious relationship with team owners. Nichols' period of restlessness, ambition, and
risk-taking following his long stint with Boston's National League team is detailed, as is the campaign to get
him into the Hall of Fame. The book includes previously unpublished photos from his descendants' archives,
many more than a century old.
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From reader reviews:

Molly Wilson:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a publication. The book Kid Nichols: A Biography of the Hall of Fame Pitcher it doesn't matter what
good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book.
If you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore
effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book features high
quality.

Dora Dickey:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, brief story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Kid Nichols: A Biography of the
Hall of Fame Pitcher that give your fun preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading
behavior all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world a great deal better then how
they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading practice only for the geeky
person but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your
good habit, you may pick Kid Nichols: A Biography of the Hall of Fame Pitcher become your current starter.

Karen Nash:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Kid Nichols: A Biography of the Hall of
Fame Pitcher guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which can be
understand by anyone who else read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet
every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt Kid
Nichols: A Biography of the Hall of Fame Pitcher as good book not simply by the cover but also by the
content. This is one book that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing a different
sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to
listening to an additional sixth sense.

Elizabeth Rivera:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that query was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know that
little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. A substantial



number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is Kid Nichols: A Biography
of the Hall of Fame Pitcher.
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