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From translating the patient’s medical records and test results to providing recommendations, the
neuropsychological evaluation incorporates the science and practice of neuropsychology, neurology, and
psychological sciences. The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology brings the practice and study of
neuropsychology into concise step-by-step focus—without skimping on scientific quality. This one-of-a-kind
assessment reference complements standard textbooks by outlining signs, symptoms, and complaints
according to neuropsychological domain (such as memory, language, or executive function), with
descriptions of possible deficits involved, inpatient and outpatient assessment methods, and possible
etiologies.

Additional chapters offer a more traditional approach to evaluation, discussing specific neurological
disorders and diseases in terms of their clinical features, neuroanatomical correlates, and assessment and
treatment considerations. Chapters in psychometrics provide for initial understanding of brain-behavior
interpretation as well as more advanced principals for neuropsychology practice including new diagnostic
concepts and analysis of change in performance over time. For the trainee, beginning clinician or seasoned
expert, this user-friendly presentation incorporating ‘quick reference guides’ throughout which will add to
the practice armentarium of beginning and seasoned clinicians alike. Key features of The Black Book of
Neuropsychology: 

Concise framework for understanding the neuropsychological referral.●

Symptoms/syndromes presented in a handy outline format, with dozens of charts and tables.●

Review of basic neurobehavioral examination procedure.●

Attention to professional issues, including advances in psychometrics and diagnoses, including tables for●

reliable change for many commonly used tests.
Special “Writing Reports like You Mean It” section and guidelines for answering referral questions.●

Includes appendices of practical information, including neuropsychological formulary.●

The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology is an indispensable resource for the range of practitioners and
scientists interested in brain-behavior relationships. Particular emphasis is provided for trainees in
neuropsychology and neuropsychologists. However, the easy to use format and concise presentation is likely
to be of particular value to interns, residents, and fellows studying neurology, neurological surgery,
psychiatry, and nurses. Finally, teachers of neuropsychological and neurological assessment may also find
this book useful as a classroom text.

"There is no other book in the field that covers the scope of material that is inside this comprehensive text.
The work might be best summed up as being a clinical neuropsychology postdoctoral residency in a book,
with the most up to date information available, so that it is also an indispensible book for practicing
neuropsychologists in addition to students and residents…There is really no book like this available today. It
skillfully brings together the most important foundationsof clinical neuropsychology with the 'nuts and bolts'
of every facet of assessment. It also reminds the more weathered neuropsychologists among us of the
essential value of neuropsychological assessment…the impact of the disease on the patient’s cognitive
functioning and behavior may only be objectively quantified through a neuropsychological assessment."



Arch Clin Neuropsychol (2011) first published online June 13, 2011

Read the full review acn.oxfordjournals.org
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From reader reviews:

Jean Young:

The book The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology: A Syndrome-Based Approach can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the best thing like a
book The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology: A Syndrome-Based Approach? A number of you have a
different opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can give many data for us. It is absolutely suitable.
Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you can give for each
other; you can share all of these. Book The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology: A Syndrome-Based
Approach has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance
the enormous world by available and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Louis Jackson:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you learn
a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply because
book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that
you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology: A Syndrome-Based Approach provide you
with new experience in looking at a book.

Raymond Bryan:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And
you also know that little person such as reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to
know that reading is very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about
something by book. Many kinds of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually
The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology: A Syndrome-Based Approach.

Russell Howell:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the The Little Black Book of Neuropsychology: A Syndrome-Based Approach when you desired it?
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