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Once again the incomparable New York Times bestselling master of suspense, Elizabeth Peters, brings an
exotic world of adventure, intrigue, and danger to vivid life, in a tale as exciting, mysterious, and powerful as
ancient Egypt.

A unique treasure obtained by unscrupulous means, the small gold statuette of an unidentified Egyptian king
is a priceless relic from a bygone era. But more than history surrounds the remarkable artifact—for it is said
that early death will come to anyone who possesses it.

Enjoying a world finally at peace, the Emersons have returned to the Valley of the Kings in 1922. With the
lengthy ban on their archaeological activities lifted, Amelia Peabody and her family look forward to delving
once more into the age-old mysteries buried in Egypt's ever-shifting sands. But a widow's strange story—and
even stranger request—is about to plunge them into a storm of secrets, treachery, superstition . . . and
murder.

The woman, a well-known author, has come bearing an ill-gotten treasure—a golden likeness of a forgotten
king—which she claims is cursed. Already, she insists, it has taken the life of her husband, and unless it is
returned to the tomb from which it was stolen, more people will die.

Intrigued by the mystery, Amelia and her clan resolve to uncover the secrets of the statue's origins, setting
off on a trail that twists and turns in directions they never anticipated—and, perhaps, toward an old nemesis
with unscrupulous new designs. But each step toward the truth seems to reveal another peril, suggesting to
the intrepid Amelia that the curse is more than mere superstition. And its next victim might well be her
irascible husband, Radcliffe, their beloved son, Ramses, his lovely wife, Nefret ... or Amelia Peabody
herself.

A novel filled with riveting suspense, pulse-pounding action, and the vibrant life of a fascinating place and
time, The Serpent on the Crown is the jewel in the crown of a grand master, the remarkable Elizabeth Peters.
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Torres:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific The Serpent on the Crown
(Amelia Peabody Book 17) book as beginning and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is more than
just a book.

Thelma Atkins:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic inside
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The
first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to try out look for
book, may be the e-book untitled The Serpent on the Crown (Amelia Peabody Book 17) can be very good
book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

George Hyler:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity
have you got when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the book you
have read is actually The Serpent on the Crown (Amelia Peabody Book 17).

Jenna Quintana:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of news.
With this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
trying to find the The Serpent on the Crown (Amelia Peabody Book 17) when you desired it?
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