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The Almanac of World Crime chronicles the exploits of the underworld—murder, robbery, arson, torture,
rape, kidnapping, extortion, and blackmail, to name only a few—and takes the reader on an iniquitous tour of
the world's gambling halls, dope parlors, cathouses, and clip joints. Everything from the devastating eruption
of Mount Vesuvius and Mount Pelée to the looting during the Black Plague is featured in these pages.
Here are the stories of some of history's outstanding killers and criminals: "Black Jack" Ketchum, Polly
Adler, "Scarface" Al Capone, "Trigger Mike" Cappola, and George Metesky, as well as The Mad Bomber,
Dutch Schultz, Belle Star, Lizzie Borden, Blue Near, Caligula, Jack the Ripper, and the Manson Gang.
Drawn from thousands of sources and illustrated with over 200 photographs and drawings, Almanac of
World Crime defines the darker side of human nature and conveniently presents it to the reader A to Z.
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Powell:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and
the resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How many people
to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this Almanac of World Crime
book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred %
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Alfredo Dunn:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
brief story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Almanac of World Crime that give your
enjoyment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can
be said as the method for people to know world far better then how they react in the direction of the world. It
can't be claimed constantly that reading routine only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who
wants to end up being success person. So , for every you who want to start reading as your good habit, you
could pick Almanac of World Crime become your own starter.

Mary Perry:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find reserve that
need more time to be study. Almanac of World Crime can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who
have those short spare time problems.

Lester Gibbons:

Beside this kind of Almanac of World Crime in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the
new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven so
don't be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Almanac of
World Crime because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you at times have book
but you don't get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in
your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. So do
you still want to miss that? Find this book as well as read it from at this point!
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